

Pace RFQ 419609 Due: 08/23/19

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	EIDorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance	
5	2510144	74.93						74.93			No Bid	78.98	79.51	No Bid	No Bid	80.86		86.85	No Bid					
Lift-U Parts 229339	COACH DOWN 6440							1-2 Weeks				Stock	5 Days			Stock		65-80 Days						
6	2510145	0.73						0.73				0.99	0.74			1.66	0.94	1.15						
Lift-U Parts 229339	COACH DOWN 6440	-						1-2 Weeks				Stock	5 Days			Stock	7 Weeks	35-50 Days						
5	2510146	885.33						885.33				890.83	891.61			955.33		1,150.80						
Lift-U Parts 229339	COACH DOWN 6440	-						1-2 Weeks				Stock	5 Days			Stock		40-55 Days						