

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
4	71733	76.03													78.98		84.80		83.97
Prevost	229388	-													28D		Stock		6W
5	72096	1,888.19				1,888.19						1,888.19			2,483.95				1,936.00
P&G Keene	229387	-				3W						Stock			30D				Stock
2	120467	12.44													12.44				
Muncie Transit	229390	-													Stock				
4	130756	767.70									816.63				767.70				
Muncie Transit	229390										Stock				Stock				
3	120147	0.30													11.75				
Muncie Transit	229390	-													Stock				
4	81203	172.22				172.22					254.09								
Interstate Power Systems	229389	-				3W					Stock								
6	130613	2.92						12.30			13.98				13.50		17.25		
Mohawk	229395	-					Stock				Stock				Stock		Stock		
2	100123	32.98													32.98				
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	-													28D				
1	71641	5.99													5.99				
Muncie Transit	229390	-													Stock				
4	100207	300.50									348.66				300.50				
Muncie Transit	229390										5D				21D				

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
4	100209	62.50									62.50				71.90				
	Interstate Power Systems	229389									Stock				30D				
7	140057	21.37			36.84		45.14								37.90		42.80		36.99
	Mohawk	229395			Stock		Stock								Stock		Stock		Stock
1	110117	593.69																	
	The Aftermarket Parts	229394																	
1	72077	48.55						48.55											
	Eldorado	229384						Stock											
1	72120	97.15						97.15											
	Eldorado	229384						6W											
5	80952	258.10									258.10				268.60		355.00		
	Interstate Power Systems	229389									5D				Stock		30D		
8	130618	223.87					223.87				254.40				244.30		318.20	300.00	240.22
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				Stock				Stock		Stock	10D	Stock
5	81298	50.30					58.11								67.70		50.30		
	Prevost	229388					Stock								21D		Stock		
8	110093	29.17		29.17			31.11				34.15		35.94		40.65	41.00	52.30		
	Vehicle Maintenance	229375		Stock			7D				14D		Stock		30D	7D	50D		
1	72145	8.59						8.59											
	Eldorado	229384						4W											
5	72148	89.04						292.42							174.16				124.33
	Mohawk	229395						Stock							21D				Stock
5	72156	21.99			21.99			37.75							22.22		22.40		
	Neopart	229378			7W			6W							35D		50D		
4	81326	154.40									154.40				157.50				
	Interstate Power Systems	229389									Stock				30D				

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
1	120550	138.43						138.43											
Eldorado	229384	-						4W											
7	72388	35.15			64.02			63.00							64.99		64.95		41.62
Mohawk	229395	-			7W			4W							35D		Stock		Stock
1	710004	21.55						21.55											
Eldorado	229384	-						2W											
4	710025	67.70						124.15							67.70		73.85		68.89
Muncie Transit	229390							6W							21D		40D		Stock
2	710044	205.00						205.15											205.00
Hydraulic Electric	229392	-						2W											14D
4	1010002	1.95						7.51								5.00			7.00
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	-						Stock								5D			14D
8	1010011	858.00			1,241.20		858.00			1,275.00					925.90		1,800.00		1,260.00
Coffman Truck	229381	-			10D		Stock			Stock					21D		25D		14D
6	1010012	1,322.36			1,448.70		1,828.67			1,395.00					2,019.99				1,488.00
Mohawk	229395	-			10D		Stock			Stock					21D				14D
2	1210016	647.06						1,090.75											647.06
Gillig	229393	-						Stock											10W
5	810026	1,000.07					1,000.07								1,050.90	1,028.45			
Coffman Truck	229381	-					Stock								21D	10D			
6	1010013	11.40			15.43		29.81								30.40		19.70		
Neopart	229378	-			Stock		Stock								21D		Stock		
3	1210021	492.46						599.35											512.33
Eldorado	229384	-						Stock											8W
4	810045	386.62					386.62								399.02		564.00		
Coffman Truck	229381	-					Stock								21D		40D		
5	810046	412.51			462.49		412.51								430.00				460.00

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
Green=Disqualified	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
1	810063	182.44													182.44				
	Muncie Transit	229390	-												30D				
2	710116	34.00						48.84										34.00	
	Hydraulic Electric	229392	-					Stock										14D	
4	810065	9.66					47.35								47.60				
	Coffman Truck	229381	-				Stock								21D				
3	810073	104.90					104.90								109.99				
	Coffman Truck	229381	-				Stock								Stock				

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID

TOTAL

		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
--	--	---	--	--	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---	---

Green=Disqualified																		
--------------------	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--	--

NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
4	810078	412.51					412.51								436.97		526.90		
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock								30D		Stock		
4	810079	412.51					412.51								487.99			425.00	
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock								30D			Stock	
2	1210048	1.29						1.29											
	Eldorado	229384						2W											
6	1010032	91.98					110.83								117.40		145.53	91.98	
	Hydraulic Electric	229392					Stock								Stock		75D	Stock	
1	1210051	886.70						886.70											
	Eldorado	229384						Stock											
5	810098	255.38					256.64								255.38		370.75		
	Muncie Transit	229390					Stock								30D		30D		
7	810110	279.92				358.41	279.92								289.87		390.98	1,075.00	
	Coffman Truck	229381				3D	Stock								30D		45D	14D	
1	810129	378.39						378.39											
	Eldorado	229384						Stock											
2	810132	124.29					124.29												
	Coffman Truck	229381					90D												
2	1210078	347.06						567.68											347.06
	Gillig	229393						10W											6W
3	810156	6.22					6.22								6.82				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock								30D				
3	810157	37.68					37.68								40.56				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock								30D				
1	810166	48.55						48.55											
	Eldorado	229384						6W											
5	810173	5.50					20.76								21.19		5.50		

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
Coffman Truck	229381	-					Stock								21D		Unapproved part		
5	810192	1,250.00					1,340.02								1,432.00			1,250.00	
Coffman Truck	229381	-					Stock								30D			14D	

Pace

RFQ# 419610

WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL																		
	0				0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Triangle Radiator	Vehicle Maintenance	Neopart	B&C Truck	Coffman Truck	Eldorado	Rex Welding	Rex Sales	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Suburban Truck	Rome Truck	Muncie Transit	MW Bus	Prevost	Hydraulic Electric	Gillig
5	810208	0.20					1.39								1.38		0.20		
	Muncie Transit	229390					Stock								30D		Unapproved part		
3	710244	68.34														69.94			69.50
	The Aftermarket Parts	229394														10D			8W
8	1010049	954.16			1,600.00		954.16			1,525.00					1,038.79		1,868.75	1,436.00	
	Coffman Truck	229381			10D		Stock			Stock					30D		30D	14D	
3	1010050	3,968.43					3,968.43								4,300.35				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock								30D				
5	1010056	44.36					60.16								64.90		86.80	44.36	
	Hydraulic Electric	229392					Stock								Stock		30D	14D	
1	1210111	10.41																	
	The Aftermarket Parts	229394																	
3	1310018	1,453.41					1,453.41				1,651.60				1,652.00				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				Stock				30D				
3	1310019	11.08					11.08				12.59				13.10				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				2D				30D				
3	1310020	2.57					2.57				2.92				2.90				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				Stock				Stock				
3	1310021	4.52					4.52				6.88				5.19				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				20D				Stock				
3	1310022	3.69					3.69				4.19				4.17				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				Stock				Stock				
3	1310024	2.75					2.75				3.17				3.19				
	Coffman Truck	229381					Stock				20D				30D				

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
4	71733	76.03	
Prevost	229388	5W	
5	72096	2,533.20	
P&G Keene	229387	14W	
2	120467	18.18	
Muncie Transit	229390	5W	
4	130756	1,350.51	1,024.36
Muncie Transit	229390	Stock	4W
3	120147	17.18	0.30
Muncie Transit	229390	6W	Unapproved part
4	81203	902.39	403.30
Interstate Power Systems	229389	8W	5W
6	130613	19.67	2.92
Mohawk	229395	Stock	Stock
2	100123	35.09	
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	Stock	
1	71641		
Muncie Transit	229390		
4	100207	430.56	391.93
Muncie Transit	229390	8W	5W

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	SKU	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
4	100209	92.39	70.62
Interstate Power Systems	229389	8W	4W
7	140057	72.02	21.37
Mohawk	229395	Stock	Stock
1	110117	593.69	
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	Stock	
1	72077		
Eldorado	229384		
1	72120		
Eldorado	229384		
5	80952	270.45	279.18
Interstate Power Systems	229389	Stock	3W
8	130618	336.86	254.86
Coffman Truck	229381	Stock	Stock
5	81298	55.20	55.10
Prevost	229388	Stock	3W
8	110093	100.55	
Vehicle Maintenance	229375	7W	
1	72145		
Eldorado	229384		
5	72148	154.25	89.04
Mohawk	229395	Stock	Stock
5	72156	25.59	
Neopart	229378	8W	
4	81326	241.71	185.00
Interstate Power Systems	229389	Stock	5W

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
4	81303	4,257.45	3,461.48
	229389	7W	5W
4	72172	41.87	
	229384	7W	
2	120498		
	229385		
1	72182		
	229384		
5	81378	32.30	19.55
	229395	11W	20D
4	72216	150.90	
	229394	Stock	
1	81417		
	229384		
-	72241		
1	81423		
	229384		
4	81430	383.12	279.73
	229381	8W	5W
6	81444	84.80	57.00
	229395	Stock	Stock
4	72294		31.60
	229390		8W
1	72334		
	229384		

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
1	120550		
Eldorado	229384		
7	72388	54.13	35.15
Mohawk	229395	Stock	Stock
1	710004		
Eldorado	229384		
4	710025		
Muncie Transit	229390		
2	710044		
Hydraulic Electric	229392		
4	1010002	1.95	
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	Stock	
8	1010011	3,238.40	1,196.00
Coffman Truck	229381	7W	Stock
6	1010012		1,322.36
Mohawk	229395		3W
2	1210016		
Gillig	229393		
5	810026	1,341.31	1,166.65
Coffman Truck	229381	4W	5W
6	1010013	40.09	11.40
Neopart	229378	Stock	Unapproved part
3	1210021	492.46	
Eldorado	229384	10W	
4	810045	613.28	
Coffman Truck	229381	Stock	
5	810046	651.80	

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
Coffman Truck	229381	Stock	
1	810050		
Eldorado	229384		

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	SKU	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
1	810063		
Muncie Transit	229390		
2	710116		
Hydraulic Electric	229392		
4	810065	63.07	9.66
Coffman Truck	229381	Stock	Unapproved part
3	810073	138.41	
Coffman Truck	229381	7W	

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
4	810078	574.20	
Coffman Truck	229381	11W	
4	810079	475.02	
Coffman Truck	229381	Stock	
2	1210048	44.72	
Eldorado	229384	Stock	
6	1010032	130.05	121.00
Hydraulic Electric	229392	6W	5W
1	1210051		
Eldorado	229384		
5	810098	295.53	281.21
Muncie Transit	229390	6W	5W
7	810110	1,196.96	557.43
Coffman Truck	229381	8W	5W
1	810129		
Eldorado	229384		
2	810132	163.99	
Coffman Truck	229381	5W	
2	1210078		
Gillig	229393		
3	810156	8.32	
Coffman Truck	229381	5W	
3	810157	47.83	
Coffman Truck	229381	5W	
1	810166		
Eldorado	229384		
5	810173	27.15	19.92

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
Coffman Truck	229381	5W	Unapproved part
5	810192	1,809.84	1,579.19
Coffman Truck	229381	6W	Stock

Pace

WHITE=NO BID

		0	0
Green=Disqualified			

NO # of Bids	Sku	The Aftermarket Parts	Mohawk
5	810208	1.60	0.24
Muncie Transit	229390	5W	Unapproved part
3	710244	68.34	
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	8W	
8	1010049	2,369.97	1,485.00
Coffman Truck	229381	5W	2W
3	1010050	5,544.40	
Coffman Truck	229381	6W	
5	1010056	80.91	
Hydraulic Electric	229392	Stock	
1	1210111	10.41	
The Aftermarket Parts	229394	Stock	
3	1310018		
Coffman Truck	229381		
3	1310019		
Coffman Truck	229381		
3	1310020		
Coffman Truck	229381		
3	1310021		
Coffman Truck	229381		
3	1310022		
Coffman Truck	229381		
3	1310024		
Coffman Truck	229381		