

Pace RFQ 419611 Due: 08/27/19

White = No Bid	TOTAL																				
Green = Disqualified																					

SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	Drivetrain Service & Components	Eldorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance
-----	-------------	------------------	--------------------------	-------------	---------------------	---------------------------------	----------	--------	------	--------------------------	-------------------	--------------	-------------	--------	--------	---------	-----------	---------	------------------	----------------------	------------	-------------------	---------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	Drivetrain Service & Components	Eldorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance
2	290602	242.09															242.09	260.60						
NFI 229365	VERY LOW STOCK																6-8 Weeks	Stock						
8	41236	140.00			181.86			433.67	140.00						141.63	140.25	141.03	150.11	155.52					
Gillig 229357		-			7 Days			4 Weeks	3 Stock Balance 2 Weeks						Stock	Stock	3-4 Weeks	5 Weeks	35-50 Days					
8	41237	89.44			114.82			281.33	89.53						93.15	89.76	89.44	94.77	98.20					
Neopart 229364		-			7 Days			4 Weeks	Stock						Sep 30th	30 Days	3-4 Weeks	6 Weeks	25-40 Days					
5	10386	35.00							195.74					35.00		82.99	78.41	92.65						
Midwest Bus 229360														Stock		4 Stock Balance 30 Days		Stock	Stock					
4	250652	10.38							10.46					11.13				10.38	12.00					
Neopart 229364		-												10 Days				7-10 Days		15-30 Days				
8	10194	10.52			16.66				10.52			22.50			11.49	11.10		14.11	11.60					10.99
Gillig 229357					7 Days				Stock			Stock			Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock					Stock
8	40106	1.87			16.89				6.15					6.33	1.87	2.14	6.25	7.84	6.70					
Mohawk 229362		-			7 Days				Stock					14 Days	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	6 Stock Balance 25-40 Days					
6	60735	615.55						615.55								1,999.76			1,900.00					
ENC 229356	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND - QTY. 8	-						2 Weeks								2 Pc Min. 70 Days			75-90 Days					
6	151458	164.56						260.64	164.56					210.00		168.45		193.66	184.83					
Gillig 229357		-						Stock	Stock					3 Weeks		Stock		Stock	2 Stock Balance 25-40 Days					
7	10193	14.37			23.53				14.37						15.28	14.89		19.26	15.85					15.58
Gillig 229357					Stock				Stock						Stock	Stock		Stock	Stock					Stock
6	290537	157.00							159.25	157.00						189.78	159.95	175.46	180.83					
HECS 229358									Stock	14 Days						Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock					
5	250595	3.35							3.50					3.35			3.97	3.57	3.80					
Midwest Bus 229360														10 Days				7-10 Days	6 Weeks	15-30 Days				
6	290484	2.34													2.64	2.34	3.13	2.41	2.70	5.50				
Muncie 229363															Sep 5th	6 Stock Balance 30 Days	Stock	Stock	30-45 Days	Stock				
1	60455	3.70																3.70						
NFI 229365		-																Stock						

Pace RFQ 419611 Due: 08/27/19

White = No Bid	TOTAL																			
Green = Disqualified																				

SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	Drivetrain Service & Components	Eldorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance
-----	-------------	------------------	--------------------------	-------------	---------------------	---------------------------------	----------	--------	------	--------------------------	-------------------	--------------	-------------	--------	--------	---------	-----------	---------	------------------	----------------------	------------	-------------------	---------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number

3	20576	21.65													53.60		60.99	21.65						
Prevost 229367	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND														21 Days		Stock	Stock						
8	41213	109.38			151.25		135.00	109.38					110.80		165.38	119.89	127.31	122.50						
Gillig 229357					7 Days		Stock	Stock					Stock		21 Days	Stock	Stock	Stock						
6	40165	1.62						8.75					9.19	1.62	4.50	8.96	9.56							
Mohawk 229362								Stock					14 Days	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock							
7	41217	82.69					161.95	93.19					105.00	87.41	92.56		82.69	108.80						
NFI 229365							Stock	2 Stock Balance 6-8 Weeks					7 Days	Stock	5 Stock Balance 21 Days		Stock	35-50 Days						
3	41169	33.34												33.34	38.20		38.49							
Mohawk 229362	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND													8 Stock Balance Sep 16th	Stock		Stock							
6	30361	7.65			10.27								8.93		7.65	7.65	9.23	8.20						
Muncie 229363	QTY. 11	-			7 Days								14 Days		Stock	Must be ordered in mult. Of 8 Stock	Stock	Stock						
7	40632	0.13			0.41								0.37	0.13	0.29	0.32	0.41	0.35						
Mohawk 229362					7 Days								14 Days	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock	Stock						
7	40509	9.42			22.82			17.99						9.42	20.46	20.34	25.86	19.00						
Mohawk 229362					7 Days			Stock						Stock	Stock	3-4 Weeks	Stock	Stock						
1	60749	272.74															272.74							
NFI 229365	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND																Stock							
1	290664	2.65					2.65																	
ENC 229356							1 Week																	
3	250698	121.36						121.36					169.57				122.50							
Gillig 229357	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND												10 Days				7-10 Days							
1	30177	2.65					2.65																	
ENC 229356							Stock																	
1	30023	43.15					43.15																	
ENC 229356							Stock																	
8	41272	24.77			31.89		47.00	28.55					29.57	32.33	30.12	24.77	31.93							
Neopart 229364					7 Days		2 Weeks	2-4 Weeks					14 Days	Sep 23rd	30 Days	Stock	5 Weeks							
9	41273	26.12			31.89		47.00	28.55					29.57	32.33	29.15	26.12	31.50	26.50						
Neopart 229364					7 Days		2 Weeks	2-4 Weeks					14 Days	Sep 23rd	30 Days	Stock	1 Stock Balance 5 Weeks	25-40 Days						

Pace RFQ 419611 Due: 08/27/19

		TOTAL																						
White = No Bid																								
Green = Disqualified																								
	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	Drivetrain Service & Components	Eldorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance
Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number																								
5	290673	812.71						1,306.56	812.71							875.42		830.94	823.00					
Gillig 229357		-						4 Weeks	1 Stock Balance 2-4 Weeks							1 Stock Balance 30 days		Stock	75-90 Days					
5	10416	367.15						367.15	575.00							440.60		441.51	525.00					
ENC 229356	RIVER HAS 0 ON HAND	-						3 Weeks	4-6 Weeks							90 Days		7 Weeks	40-55 Days					
4	250728	20.54							20.54					20.82			20.56	26.26						
Gillig 229357		-							1-2 Weeks								7-10 Days	3 Stock Balance 11 Weeks						
5	250730	0.16							0.17					10 Days			1.14	0.20	0.20					
Midwest Bus 229360		-							1-2 Weeks					10 Days			7-10 Days	Stock	15-30 Days					
4	60790	503.08						776.95								503.08		717.11	530.80					
Muncie 229363	RIVER HAS 0 ON HAND	-						1 Week								42 Days		8 Weeks	35-50 Days					
1	290684	9.67						9.67																
ENC 229356		-						1 Week																
1	290687	13.99						13.99																
ENC 229356		-						1 Week																
3	250743	75.85							77.76									76.85						
Midwest Bus 229360	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND	-							1-2 Weeks					10 Days				7-10 Days						
1	10424	12.85						12.85																
ENC 229356		-						1 Week																
3	41294	1,050.86						1,396.45	1,239.76										1,050.86					
NFI 229365	WEST HAS 0 ON HAND - QTY. 3	-						2-4 Weeks	5 Pc Min. 8-10 Weeks										7 Weeks					
5	250765	18.14							18.14					18.54			18.55	23.47	19.50					
Gillig 229357		-							1-2 Weeks					10 Days			7-10 Days	11 Weeks	20-35 Days					
7	41332	284.88						315.00	317.95					315.00	328.38	342.22	284.88		360.60					
Neopart 229364		-						Stock	1 Week					14 Days	Sep 16th	30 Days	Stock		Stock					
2	290695	62.87						91.75									62.87							
Muncie 229363		-						Stock									Stock							

Pace RFQ 419611 Due: 08/27/19

		TOTAL																							
White = No Bid																									
Green = Disqualified																									

SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	Drivetrain Service & Components	Eldorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance
-----	-------------	------------------	--------------------------	-------------	---------------------	---------------------------------	----------	--------	------	--------------------------	-------------------	--------------	-------------	--------	--------	---------	-----------	---------	------------------	----------------------	------------	-------------------	---------------------

Number of Bids, Winning Bidder & PO Number	SKU	Winning Bid	Acme Truck Brake	Autex Automotive Devices	B & C Truck	Coffman Truck Sales	Drivetrain Service & Components	Eldorado	Gillig	HECS	Interstate Power Systems	Kirk's Automotive	Lift-U Parts	Midwest Bus	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	NFI Parts	Prevost	Rome Truck Parts	Suburban Truck Parts	Sun Source	Transit Parts 101	Vehicle Maintenance
1	310032	50.48	50.48																					
Acme Truck 229391		-	Stock																					
1	1510136	101.03						101.03																
ENC 229356		-						2 Weeks																
4	610072	36.10			36.10										DQ	37.80		42.42	53.83					
Coffman Truck 229354		-			Stock									Mohawk part #5273379 which is not an approved OEM.	Stock		Stock	Stock						
6	2910027	99.65							99.65	105.84						115.78	101.56	126.83	103.90					
Gillig 229357		-						Stock	14 Days						Stock	1-2 Weeks	Stock	30-45 Days						
3	610081	88.12			88.12										DQ	95.17		120.14	DQ					
Coffman Truck 229354		-			Stock									Mohawk part #5333477 which is not an approved OEM.	30 Days		Stock	Dayco part #89478 which is not an approved OEM.						
3	2510071	32.09							32.15				32.38				32.09							
Neopart 229364		-							1-2 Weeks				10 Days				7-10 Days							
2	1510177	3.69						3.69										21.17						
ENC 229356		-						1 Week										Stock						
4	610097	230.00							230.00							241.00		286.62	275.89					
Gillig 229357		-						4-6 Weeks							Stock		6 Stock Balance 7 Weeks	10-25 Days						
1	2910039	7.28																7.28						
NFI 229365		-																Stock						
4	2510144	74.93							74.93				79.51				80.86		86.85					
Gillig 229357		-						1-2 Weeks					10 Days			Stock		65-80 Days						
5	2510145	0.73							0.73				0.74			1.66	0.92		1.15					
Gillig 229357		-						1-2 Weeks					10 Days			Stock	7 Weeks	35-50 Days						
4	2510146	885.33							885.33				891.61			955.33		1,150.80						
Gillig 229357		-						1-2 Weeks					30 Days			Stock		40-55 Days						