VARIABLE PRICING A - DIESEL FUEL BID 418269 - 6/14/2018 - 11:00 AM

BID TABULATION

Fourth
Qtr 2018
Option

PERIOD ITEM BIDDERS
Third Mansfield Qil
Qtr 2018 Luke Oil Company of RKA Petro_leum Heritage Petroleum | Petroleum Traders TAC Energy
. . Companies
Gainesville

ULSD OPIS $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2000 $2.2006 $2.2006
UST TAX $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141
FREIGHT No Bid $0.0400 $0.0392 $0.0648 $0.0459 $0.0425
MARGIN No Bid -$0.0261 $0.0045 $0.0125 -$0.0222 $0.0023
UNIT COST No Bid $2.2286 $2.2584 $2.2773 $2.2384 $2.2595
QUANTITY 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198
TOTAL COST $2,893,164.06 $2,931,850.30 $2,956,386.30 $2,905,886.40 $2,933,284.15

First
Qtr 2019

ULSD OPIS $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2000 $2.2006 $2.2006
UST TAX $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141
FREIGHT No Bid $0.0400 $0.0392 $0.0648 $0.0459 $0.0425
MARGIN No Bid -$0.0155 $0.0245 $0.0125 -$0.0375 -$0.0073
UNIT COST $2.2147 $2.2392 $2.2784 $2.2773 $2.2231 $2.2499
QUANTITY 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198
TOTAL COST $2,906,924.96 $2,957,814.30 $2,956,386.30 $2,886,023.97 $2,920,802.25

Option

ULSD OPIS $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2000 $2.2006 $2.2006
UST TAX $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141
FREIGHT No Bid $0.0400 $0.0392(No Bid $0.0459 $0.0425
MARGIN No Bid -$0.0191 $0.0195(No Bid -$0.0475 -$0.0206
UNIT COST $2.2147 $2.2356 $2.2734 $2.2141 $2.2131 $2.2366
QUANTITY 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198 1,298,198
TOTAL COST No Bid $2,902,251.45 $2,951,323.30{No Bid $2,873,041.99 $2,903,596.44

Date: 6/14/2018

Pace

Employees:

Attendees 4
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VARIABLE PRICING METHOD B - DIESEL FUEL BID 418269 - 6/14/2018

PERIOD ITEM BIDDERS
Third and Mansfield Qil RKA Petroleum
Fourth Qtr. Luke Oil Company of . Heritage Petroleum | Petroleum Traders TAC Energy
. g Companies
2018 Gainesville
ULSD OPIS $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2000 $2.2006 $2.2006
UST TAX $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141
FREIGHT No Bid $0.0400 $0.0392 $0.0648 $0.0459 $0.0425
MARGIN No Bid -$0.0215 $0.0110 $0.0125 -$0.0342 -$0.0025
UNIT COST $2.2147 $2.2332 $2.2649 $2.2773 $2.2264 $2.2547
QUANTITY 2,596,396 2,596,396 2,596,396 2,596,396 2,596,396 2,596,396
TOTAL COST No Bid $5,798,271.55 $5,880,577.30 $5,912,772.61 $5,780,616.05 $5,854,086.40
VARIABLE PRICING METHOD C - DIESEL FUEL BID 418269 - 6/14/2018
PERIOD ITEM BIDDERS
Third and
Fourth Qtr. . .
Mansfield Qil
2918 and Luke Oil Company of RKA Petro_leum Heritage Petroleum | Petroleum Traders TAC Energy
First and . . Companies
Gainesville
Second
Quarter 2019
ULSD OPIS $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2006 $2.2000 $2.2006 $2.2006
UST TAX $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141 $0.0141
FREIGHT $0.0366 $0.0400 $0.0392|No Bid $0.0459 $0.0425
MARGIN -$0.0200 -$0.0327 $0.0135|No Bid -$0.0390 -$0.0097
UNIT COST $2.2313 $2.2220 $2.2674 $2.2141 $2.2216 $2.2475
QUANTITY 5,192,792 5,192,792 5,192,792 5,192,792 5,192,792 5,192,792
TOTAL COST $11,586,676.78 $11,538,383.82 $11,774,136.00{No Bid $11,536,306.70 $11,670,595.74
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