O pace
Connecting Communities

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Tabulation

Bid Solicitatio

n Date

10/15/2024

IFB No:
422619

Bid Opening Time | Bid Opening Date
2:00 p.m. 11/12/2024

_ Bidder Name(s)| Brandenburger Plumbing, Inc. ALFA Chicago, Inc. Sugrue Builders, LLC Antigua, Inc.
Line Qty Item Description Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total
1 1 |. GENERAL CONSTRUCTION - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid 0.840 0.840 0.994 0.994 1.089 1.089
2 1 Il. CONCRETE/ASPHALT - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid 0.940 0.940 no bid no bid 1.092 1.092
3 1 lll. PLUMBING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.444 1.444 0.916 0.916 no bid no bid 1.091 1.091
4 1 IV. ELECTRICAL - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid 0.940 0.940 no bid no bid 1.089 1.089
5 1 V. MECHANICAL HEATING, VENTILATION, AND AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) - AW no bid no bid 0.916 0.916 no bid no bid 1.091 1.091
6 1 VI. ROOFING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid 0.940 0.940 no bid no bid 1.088 1.088
7 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
8 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
9 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
10 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
11 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
12 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
13 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
14 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
15 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
16 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
17 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
18 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
19 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
20 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
21 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
22 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
23 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
24 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
25 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
Total Bid Amount [ | —— L —w— L —m—r——
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O pace
Connecting Communities

Bid Tabulation

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date

10/15/2024

IFB No: Bid Opening Time | Bid Opening Date
422619 2:00 p.m. 11/12/2024

_ Bidder Name(s) SMB Contracting, Inc. McDonagh Demoalition, Inc. Sharlen Electric Company Robe, Inc.

Line Qty Item Description Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total
1 1 |. GENERAL CONSTRUCTION - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.136 1.136 0.754 0.754 no bid no bid 1.093 1.093
2 1 Il. CONCRETE/ASPHALT - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.143 1.143 0.754 0.754 no bid no bid 1.138 1.138
3 1 lll. PLUMBING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid 0.754 0.754 no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 1 IV. ELECTRICAL - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.143 1.143 no bid no bid blank blank no bid no bid
5 1 V. MECHANICAL HEATING, VENTILATION, AND AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) - AW no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
6 1 VI. ROOFING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.143 1.143 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
7 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
8 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
9 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
10 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
11 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
12 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
13 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
14 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
15 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
16 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
17 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
18 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
19 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
20 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
21 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
22 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
23 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
24 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
25 0.000 0.000 0.000

Total Bid Amount [T Y —— L —w——"s —wsy
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O pace
Connecting Communities

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after

Bid Tabulation

determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date

10/15/2024

IFB No:
422619

Bid Opening Time
2:00 p.m.

Bid Opening Date
11/12/2024

F.H. Paschen, S.N. Nielsen &

_ Bidder Name(s) Anchor Mechanical, Inc. Associates LLC Maman Corp Stingray Electric LLC
Line Qty Item Description Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total
1 1 |. GENERAL CONSTRUCTION - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 0.752 0.752 1.0187 1.0187 1.046 1.046 no bid no bid
2 1 Il. CONCRETE/ASPHALT - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 0.752 0.752 1.0187 1.0187 no bid no bid no bid no bid
3 1 lll. PLUMBING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 0.752 0.752 1.0187 1.0187 no bid no bid no bid no bid
4 1 IV. ELECTRICAL - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 0.752 0.752 no bid no bid no bid no bid 1.0421 1.0421
5 1 V. MECHANICAL HEATING, VENTILATION, AND AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) - AW 0.752 0.752 1.0409 1.0409 no bid no bid no bid no bid
6 1 VI. ROOFING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 0.752 0.752 1.0409 1.0409 no bid no bid no bid no bid
7 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
8 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
9 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
10 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
11 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
12 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
13 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
14 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
15 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
16 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
17 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
18 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
19 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
20 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
21 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
22 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
23 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
24 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
25 0.000 0.000 0.000

Total Bid Amount Ty e —wm"r—
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O pace
Connecting Communities

Bid Tabulation

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date

10/15/2024

IFB No: Bid Opening Time | Bid Opening Date
422619 2:00 p.m. 11/12/2024

_ o Name(S)

Leopardo Construction

Griggs Mitchell & Alma of IL

Taza Construction DBA Tiles

Construction, Inc.

August 2015 Revision 1

dba GMA Construction Group in Style, LLC

Line Qty Item Description Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total Figure Total
1 1 |. GENERAL CONSTRUCTION - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 0.980 0.980 1.120 1.120 1.180 1.180 0.923 0.923
2 1 Il. CONCRETE/ASPHALT - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid no bid no bid 1.180 1.180 0.923 0.923
3 1 Il. PLUMBING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 0.923 0.923
4 1 IV. ELECTRICAL - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 0.923 0.923
5 1 V. MECHANICAL HEATING, VENTILATION, AND AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) - AW no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 0.923 0.923
6 1 VI. ROOFING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE no bid no bid no bid no bid 1.180 1.180 0.923 0.923
7 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
8 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
9 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
10 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
11 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
12 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
13 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
14 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
15 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
16 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
17 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
18 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
19 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
20 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
21 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
22 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
23 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
24 0.000 0.000 0.000 0.000
25 0.000 0.000 0.000

Total Bid Amount I ——wsr
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Connecting Communities

Bid Tabulation

NOTE: Information contained within this document is a result of the public opening and
reading of bids. Award information announcing the lowest responsive and responsible
bidder(s) will be posted on Pace's website under the "Awarded Bids" page after
determination of the lowest responsive and responsible bid(s).

Bid Solicitation Date

10/15/2024

IFB No:
422619

Bid Opening Time
2:00 p.m.

Bid Opening Date
11/12/2024

Bidder Name(s)

Ashlaur Construction
Company, Inc.

Line Qty Item Description Figure Total
1 1 . GENERAL CONSTRUCTION - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.020 1.020
2 1 Il. CONCRETE/ASPHALT - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.020 1.020
3 1 Ill. PLUMBING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.020 1.020
4 1 IV. ELECTRICAL - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.020 1.020
5 1 V. MECHANICAL HEATING, VENTILATION, AND AIR CONDITIONING (HVAC) - AW 1.020 1.020
6 1 VI. ROOFING - AWARD CRITERIA FIGURE 1.020 1.020
7 0.000
8 0.000
9 0.000
10 0.000
11 0.000
12 0.000
13 0.000
14 0.000
15 0.000
16 0.000
17 0.000
18 0.000
19 0.000
20 0.000
21 0.000
22 0.000
23 0.000
24 0.000
25 ‘

Total Bid Amount [
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