

	Pace		RFQ# 424782												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
	7	41237	117.95			171.70			118.96	130.44	117.95	343.43	123.45		136.64
Kirks		237547	-			6 Wk			4 wk	30 d	stock	stock	stock		stock
	7	41131	56.10			155.10	135.50		113.36	147.60			131.73	123.98	56.10
Mohawk		237551	-			14 Wk	stock		18 wk	60 d			94 d	4 M	3w
	5	200520	20.81			54.73		54.30	39.74	43.01					20.81
Mohawk		237551	-			Stock		3 wk	4 wk	stock					stock
	6	200522	25.99			70.89		35.37	63.10	25.99				92.40	28.50
Muncie		237546				5 wk		3 wk	4 wk	stock				4w	2w
	6	30014	4.40			6.64	8.18		4.58	5.92			5.05		4.40
Mohawk		237551	-			5 wk	stock		3 wk	30 d			stock		stock
	6	200547	571.96			844.70		815.25	615.57	662.75				571.96	704.50
Midwest Transit		237550	-			8 wk		3 wk	4 wk	30 d				6w	4w
	6	41238	120.93			171.70			120.93	128.64	120.95		123.45		137.37
Neopart Transit		237545	-			6 wk			4 wk	21 d	stock		stock		4w
	7	40798	116.24			174.51	135.54		122.75	450.08		116.24	123.45		153.22
Eldorado		237548	-			9 wk	stock		4 wk	21 d		6 wk	stock		2w
	2	30376	59.25			59.25				59.62					
Aftermarket Parts		237542	-			10 wk				stock					
	4	200748	46.15			61.62		61.15	46.15	48.92					
Neopart Transit		237545				5 wk		3 wk	4 wk	30 d					

	Pace		RFQ# 424782												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
5	41216	272.00				273.60				336.88		272.00	415.61		348.58
Eldorado	237548					8 wk				stock		3 wk	120 d		stock
6	200863	10.40			11.72	18.35	10.58			13.50			10.40		10.98
Vehicle Maintenance	237549				4 stock, need 228	10 wk	stock			30 d			stock		4w
4	200072	12.50				15.24		20.70	12.50	12.69					
Neopart Transit	237545					5 wk		3 wk	4 wk	stock					
5	20670	299.04				397.99	341.25		299.04	355.08			340.12		
Neopart Transit	237545	-				14 wk	stock		3 wk	stock			stock		
6	200622	85.98				114.72		88.00	131.19	85.98				139.73	126.93
Muncie	237546					10 wk		2 wk	6 wk	stock				2w	stock
4	40165	11.94				16.19			11.94	13.34					49.70
Neopart Transit	237545					5 wk			3 wk	37 d					4w
4	10405	140.04				258.62				189.79		150.39			140.04
Mohawk	237551	-				20 wk				stock		3 wk			stock
5	30361	9.64				20.00			9.64	12.40			11.89		12.55
Neopart Transit	237545	-				25 wk			3 wk	stock			stock		unapproved part
7	40907	80.27				122.95	105.42		89.86	116.84			97.93	98.95	80.27
Mohawk	237551	-				5 wk	stock		3 wk	21 d			stock	2w	stock
5	40922	19.85				48.97			23.43	32.90			26.44		19.85
Mohawk	237551	-				14 wk			3 wk	stock			stock		4w

Pace		RFQ# 424782												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL												
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified														
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
4	41205	1.36			1.87				1.36			3.11		1.38
Mohawk	237551	-			5 wk				21 d - MOQ 20			stock		stock
5	10001	0.35			1.63			1.26	1.46			1.74		0.35
Mohawk	237551	-			5 wk			3 wk	stock			stock		stock
5	40842	7.73			11.12			7.73	8.85			8.81		7.87
Neopart Transit	237545	-			5 wk			3 wk	stock			stock		stock
5	40596	0.60			2.50			1.85	0.82			2.41		0.60
Mohawk	237551	-			5 wk			3 wk	stock			stock		stock
7	41132	93.10			155.73	133.53		113.82	148.20			131.73	121.75	93.10
Mohawk	237551	-			9 wk	stock		14 wk	60 d			84 d	4m	4w
4	200751	195.08			296.83			212.31	233.99				195.08	
Midwest Transit	237550	-			5 wk			4 wk	30 d				4w	
4	10411	129.06			153.02				129.06	130.00	131.00			
Muncie	237546	-			13 wk				stock	stock	stock			
7	41273	42.60			59.68	47.75		42.60	53.00		53.59	56.42		53.74
Neopart Transit	237545	-			8 wk	stock		3 wk	30 d		3 wk	stock		4w
5	200951	765.37			1,097.23			799.60	871.02		917.26		765.37	
Midwest Transit	237550	-			4 wk			4 wk	30 d		4 wk		4w	
2	41294	1,603.35			1,654.50						1,603.35			
Eldorado	237548	-			24 wk						25 wk			

	Pace		RFQ# 424782												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
5	30161	25.25				25.25			50.35	37.44			25.42		48.36
Aftermarket Parts		237542	-			233 wk			6 wk	45 d			stock		stock
7	41332	674.53				932.97	769.73		674.53	847.92			726.14	742.78	850.06
Neopart Transit		237545	-			14 wk - MOQ 16	stock		10 wk	75 d			stock	4m	3w
1	30483	196.53										196.53			
Eldorado		237548	-									14 wk			
3	110003	202.39				260.06				202.39		221.00			
Muncie		237546	-			33 wk				105 d		stock			
1	110004	131.02										131.02			
Eldorado		237548	-									stock			
5	410000	190.72				244.68			197.04	214.00		190.72			209.34
Eldorado		237548	-			10 wk			8 wk	21 d		6 wk			4w
5	410001	1,200.00				1,253.20	1,561.22		1,200.00			1,449.80			1,702.66
Neopart Transit		237545	-			stock	stock		3 wk			4 wk			3w
5	410002	1,200.00				1,253.20	1,561.22		1,200.00			1,449.80			1,200.79
Neopart Transit		237545	-			16 wk	1 stock, need 7		3 wk			4 wk			3w
7	410006	124.61				281.52	327.33		215.22	259.44	169.00		305.61		124.61
Kirks		237547	-			16 wk	stock		3 wk	stock	stock		stock		unapproved part
6	410007	64.10				188.80	161.88		146.61	169.69			152.70		64.10
Neopart Transit		237545	-			14 wk	stock		3 wk	stock			stock		unapproved part

	Pace		RFQ# 424782												
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
5	410009	178.35				244.68			1,897.04	214.64		178.35			209.34
Eldorado	237548	-				10 wk			8 wk	21 d		6 wk			5w
9	410010	149.84				230.60	401.09		176.45	207.59	166.90	336.35	376.37	336.89	149.84
Kirks	237547	-				6 wk	stock		3 wk	stock	stock	2 wk	stock	2w	unapproved part
5	2010004	15.67				46.95		420.05		38.78		15.67			37.69
Eldorado	237548	-				5 wk		10 wk		30 d		7 wk			4w
5	110005	433.75				568.23	487.71		433.75	546.50			479.43		
Neopart Transit	237545	-				20 wk	stock		4 wk	90 d			stock		
6	410012	124.61				281.52				259.44	169.00		305.61	260.79	124.61
Kirks	237547	-				16 wk				stock	stock		stock	2w	unapproved part
1	110006	300.46										300.46			
Eldorado	237548	-										16 wk			
5	2010016	225.40				283.94		285.75		225.40		300.46			248.33
Muncie	237546	-				5 wk		2 wk		30 d		14 wk			5w
2	2410008	7.57				7.57				8.17					
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-				10 wk				stock					
5	2010021	53.78				291.91			212.16	228.95				190.50	53.78
Midwest Transit	237550	-				5 wk			4 wk	30 d				4w	unapproved part
4	2010022	4.68				14.65		4.68		8.83					8.84
CBM US	237544	-				stock		10 wk		stock					unapproved part

	Pace			RFQ# 424782											
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
4		110014	111.56			168.81				132.45	123.00	111.56			
	Eldorado	237548	-			15 wk				stock	stock	8 wk			
4		310008	109.54			151.55				118.91	109.54	110.00			
	Kirks	237547	-			16 wk				98 D	stock	8 wk			
1		110018	1,096.54									1,096.54			
	Eldorado	237548	-									10 wk			
4		310012	115.11			223.05				260.24	347.00				115.11
	Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			11 wk				21 D	stock				unapproved part
1		110019	53.75									53.75			
	Eldorado	237548	-									stock			
1		2010027	139.42									139.42			
	Eldorado	237548	-									stock			
-		2010028	-												
			-												
6		410034	312.94			424.74			313.83	333.26	312.94		314.15		349.20
	Kirks	237547	-			stock			6 wk	30 D	stock		stock		4w
6		410035	504.89			735.95			508.92	547.93	504.89		516.37		573.44
	Kirks	237547	-			6 wk			6 wk	21 D	stock		stock		4w
6		410036	499.00			735.95			506.56	547.93	499.00		516.37		573.44
	Kirks	237547	-			6 wk			6 wk	21 D	stock		stock		4w

	Pace			RFQ# 424782											
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
1		110022	43.43									43.43			
	Eldorado	237548	-									stock			
1		310021	1.63									1.63			
	Eldorado	237548	-									stock			
5		2010037	508.17			856.56			628.03	671.32		508.17		581.73	
	Eldorado	237548	-			5 wk			4 wk	30 d		8 wk		4w	
1		410070	136.15									136.15			
	Eldorado	237548	-									8 wk			
2		2010040	5,751.40	5,751.40		8,397.60									
	Cummins	237541	-	Stock		7 wk									
1		110027	2.00									2.00			
	Eldorado	237548	-									2 wk			
4		2010045	7.12			11.50				7.12			16.99		8.77
	Muncie	237546	-			stock				47 d			stock		unapproved part
7		410080	420.97			810.97	652.55		561.44	649.81			611.56	627.91	420.97
	Mohawk	237551	-			10 wk	stock		3 wk	28 d			stock	2w	stock
6		110042	46.72			61.12	46.72		47.57	59.89			47.24		61.09
	Suburban Truck	237543	-			5 wk	2 wk		4 wk	30 d			stock		stock
1		2010064	108.62									108.62			
	Eldorado	237548	-									5 wk			

	Pace		RFQ# 424782											
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL												
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified														
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
3	110058	296.01			296.01				297.02					347.00
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock				stock					stock
2	410103	33.33			33.33						48.89			
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			9 wk						4 wk			
1	310052	196.81			196.81									
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock									
3	410109	721.43			1,524.54		972.12		721.43					
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			15w		unapproved part		unapproved part					
3	410111	721.43			1,524.54		972.12		721.43					
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock		unapproved part		unapproved part					
4	410117	0.92			1.09				1.03			3.11		0.92
Mohawk	237551	-			stock				40 d - MOQ 50			stock		stock
2	210032	14.74			14.74				17.30					
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock				stock					
1	110070	50.74			50.74									
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			10 wk									
4	410131	22.85			54.72				58.58			67.35		22.85
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock				stock			stock		unapproved part
3	110076	103.04			544.67		186.70							103.04
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock		unapproved part							unapproved part

	Pace		RFQ# 424782											
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL												
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified														
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Interstate Power	Aftermarket Parts	Suburban Truck	CBM US	Neopart	Muncie	Kirks	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Midwest Transit	Mohawk
1	210077	435.66			435.66									
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			9 wk									
4	110102	58.58			554.74		490.49		58.58					227.32
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock		unapproved part		unapproved part					unapproved part
1	210078	1.76			1.76									
Aftermarket Parts	237542	-			stock									
1	310059	10.54									10.54			
Eldorado	237548	-									stock			