

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	SKU	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
3	60734	3.55				6.11	3.55		4.81	
Muncie	237556	-				stock	30d		stock	
2	81080	6.96	6.96				8.18			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	60695	9.27	9.27				10.74			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				60d			
2	60381	31.40				31.40	33.63			
Kirks	237555					stock	stock			
4	81262	6.89				10.75	7.22	146.56	6.89	
Vehicle Maintenance	237558	-				stock	stock	8w	stock	
-	81055	-								
		-								

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
5	60745	80.18	141.22		83.70	80.18	92.25		86.78	
Kirks	237555	-	stock		8w	stock	stock		stock	
1	60380	14.80				14.80				
Kirks	237555	-				stock				
1	60412	24.60					24.60			
Muncie	237556	-					stock			
2	60494	12.88					15.49		12.88	
Vehicle Maintenance	237558						30d		stock	
1	81162	14.72					14.72			
Muncie	237556						stock			
2	81298	76.59					76.59			89.03
Muncie	237556						stock			stock

	Pace				RFQ# 424783						
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0		
Green=Disqualified											
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	
NO # of Bids											
2	81416	6.34					8.09	6.34			
Eldorado	237557	-					21d	stock			
2	81422	3.08	3.08				3.63				
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock				
2	60790	690.67					801.64	690.67			
Eldorado	237557	-					stock	14w			
1	60792	246.67						246.67			
Eldorado	237557	-						6w			
2	81441	96.60	96.69				96.60				
Muncie	237556	-	stock				90d				
2	81444	61.77					81.45			61.77	
Mohawk	237559	-					60d			stock	

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
2	81502	27.93					35.90		27.93	
Vehicle Maintenance	237558	-					stock		stock	
3	81519	74.00				74.00	97.66		133.45	
Kirks	237555	-				stock	stock		stock	
2	81521	20.76					20.76		21.81	
Muncie	237556	-					stock		stock	
2	81534	43.15					52.19	43.15		
Eldorado	237557	-					120d	8w		
-	610008	-								
		-								
2	610009	5.50					5.50	6.03		
Muncie	237556	-					stock	3w		

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance
	1	810010	1,260.44					1,260.44		
	Muncie	237556	-					30d		
	2	810017	116.31					116.98		116.31
	Vehicle Maintenance	237558	-					stock		stock
	2	610018	70.85	70.85				84.36		
	Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d		
	4	610019	89.00	233.88		120.68	89.00	118.62		
	Kirks	237555	-	stock		8w	stock	30d		
	2	810026	1,373.79	1,373.79				1,599.83		
	Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock		
	1	810027	1,279.41					1,279.41		
	Muncie	237556	-					42d		

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
2	810028	96.20					148.56	96.20		
Eldorado	237557	-					stock	6w		
3	610026	136.95			136.95	141.00	219.64			
Neopart	237554	-			6w	stock	stock			
2	610028	66.99					67.58		66.99	
Vehicle Maintenance	237558	-					stock		stock	
2	610031	43.93	43.93				47.78			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				90d			
1	610035	26.80					26.80			
Muncie	237556	-					stock			
2	810049	163.97	163.97				193.64			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				21d			

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
2	610049	9.41	9.41				11.16			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			
4	610050	26.22	161.60		35.32		26.95		26.22	
Vehicle Maintenance	237558	-	stock		6w		stock		stock	
3	610053	25.43	40.04				37.13			25.43
Mohawk	237559	-	stock				30d			stock
1	810064	9,942.19					9,942.19			
Muncie	237556	-					60d			
2	610055	77.00	77.00				87.41			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			
4	810066	114.95	223.05	114.95		122.50	253.98			
Midwest Transit	237553	-	stock	2w		stock	70d			

		Pace		RFQ# 424783							
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0		
Green=Disqualified											
		Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids											
3	810068	83.22	83.22					97.13		114.11	
Cummins	237552	-	stock					30d		stock	
1	810070	1,512.64						1,512.64			
Muncie	237556	-						30d			
2	810073	151.90	169.30					151.90			
Muncie	237556	-	stock					90d			
2	810075	385.69	385.69					428.54			
Cummins	237552	-	stock					stock			
2	610058	141.06	141.06					167.43			
Cummins	237552	-	119d					30d			
1	810078	488.88						488.88			
Muncie	237556	-						90d			

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
1	810079	515.41					515.41			
Muncie	237556	-					90d			
2	810083	110.79	110.79				131.62			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810086	122.27	122.27				142.52			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	610064	122.80	122.80				146.80			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			
2	810123	84.46	84.46				101.76			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810141	84.04	95.26				84.04			
Muncie	237556	-	stock				stock			

	Pace				RFQ# 424783						
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL									
		0			0	0	0	0	0		
Green=Disqualified											
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk	
NO # of Bids											
2	610072	56.94	56.94				68.72				
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock				
3	610073	7.31				8.99	10.50		7.31		
Vehicle Maintenance	237558	-				stock	30d		stock		
2	810154	12.77	12.77				13.14				
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock				
2	610080	244.40	244.40				331.97				
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock				
	810157	102.37	102.37				118.56				
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d				
2	810159	58.74	58.74				70.33				
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d				

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
Sku		Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
2	810160	113.45	113.45				134.28			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810161	118.45	118.45				140.32			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810162	49.26	49.26				57.99			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810163	125.93	125.93				147.60			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				60d			
2	810165	980.15					980.15	1,060.65		
Muncie	237556	-					stock	10w		
1	810169	31.19						31.19		
Eldorado	237557	-						11w		

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
1	810170	3.30						3.30		
Eldorado	237557	-						4w		
2	810176	699.97	786.29				699.97			
Muncie	237556	-	stock				stock			
1	810183	2,167.84					2,167.84			
Muncie	237556	-					30d			
2	810184	99.51	99.51				116.37			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			
1	810211	6,430.97					6,430.97			
Muncie	237556	-					30d			
2	810230	4.83	4.83				5.69			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	SKU	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
1	810232	543.30					543.30			
Muncie	237556	-					stock			
2	610115	7.16	7.16				8.43			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				21d			
2	810245	362.09	362.09				425.60			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
1	810253	1,346.55					1,346.55			
Muncie	237556	-					30d			
1	810269	5,850.46					5,850.46			
Muncie	237556	-					30d			
-	810276	-								
		-								

	Pace		RFQ# 424783							
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
3	810277	35.81					43.19		45.33	35.81
Mohawk	237559	-					21d		stock	stock
2	810337	81.04	81.04				95.67			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810338	152.33	152.33				177.45			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	810346	42.67	42.67				50.82			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				21d			
2	610145	140.39	140.39				171.38			
Cummins	237552	-	49d				21d			
2	610146	140.39	140.39				175.49			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			

	Pace		RFQ# 424783							
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
2	810384	287.69	287.69				344.51			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
2	610187	35.84	35.84				42.17			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			
2	810402	73.94	73.94				86.97			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
1	810412	6,920.16					6,920.16			
Muncie	237556	-					30d			
1	610188	2,800.00				2,800.00				
		-				unapproved part				
2	810424	145.19	152.62				145.19			
Muncie	237556	-	stock				90d			

Pace		RFQ# 424783								
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL								
		0			0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified										
	Sku	Winning bid	Cummins	Midwest Transit	Neopart	Kirks	Muncie	Eldorado	Vehicle Maintenance	Mohawk
NO # of Bids										
2	810426	1.75	1.75				2.04			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d			
1	810435	3,920.00					3,920.00			
Muncie	237556	-					21d			
1	610214	1,950.00				1,950.00				
Kirks	237555	-				stock				
2	810561	170.09	170.09				213.59			
Cummins	237552	-	stock				stock			
3	810564	17.13	17.13				19.98	26.80		
Cummins	237552	-	stock				30d	8w		
1	610245	2.63					2.63			
Muncie	237556	-					21d			