

RFQ# 424799													
Pace													
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL											
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified													
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Eldorado	Kirks	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	CBM US	A&A
5	41131	51.10		132.99		111.52		51.10	147.60		155.10		
Mohawk	237605	-		1w		3w		stk	60d		14w		
4	40932	1.23						1.23	2.69	2.26	3.55		
Mohawk	237605	-						stk	stk	3w	stk		
4	200522	25.99						26.25	25.99		70.89	30.20	
Muncie	237606	-						9w	stk		5w	14d	
4	200522	25.99						26.25	25.99		70.89	30.20	
Muncie	237606							stk	stk		5w	14d	
7	200548	23.20			25.35	88.45		25.42	24.85	23.20	26.67	25.00	
Neopart	237612	-			4w	4w		2w	30d	4w	5w	14d	
7	40798	116.24		135.54	126.00	116.24		151.22	150.08	117.00	174.51		
Eldorado	237603	-		1w	stk	6w		2w	30d	3w	8w		
5	40953	14.75			14.75		17.30	39.64	16.00		44.64		
Gillig	237602	-			stk		stk	stk	stk		stk		
5	41216	273.60			275.00	274.00		476.36	336.88		273.60		
Aftermarket Parts	237613	-			stk	3w		stk	stk		stk		

	RFQ# 424799												
	Pace												
WHITE=NO BID	TOTAL												
	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified													
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Eldorado	Kirks	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	CBM US	A&A
7	41215	174.47		208.06	177.79	174.47		235.54	228.47	179.01	258.56		
Eldorado	237603	-		1w	stk	5w		stk	45d	3w	stk		
6	200863	10.45	11.72	10.58				10.90	12.39		21.01		10.45
A&A	237614		2w	1w				stk	30d		11w		5d
5	41035	2.51			5.75			8.81	5.72	6.97	2.51		
Aftermarket Parts	237613				stk			stk	30d	3w	stk		
5	41217	192.89				243.99		204.32	207.71	192.89	210.43		
Neopart	237612					4w		5w	30d	8w	10w		
4	41205	1.11						1.38	1.36	1.11	1.87		
Neopart	237612							4w	ord qty 20, need 30	3w	5w		
4	40077	0.67						0.67	1.31	1.40	1.82		
Mohawk	237605	-						stk	stk	3w	stk		
6	10001	0.30			1.59	44.80		0.30	1.46	0.97	1.63		
Mohawk	237605				stk	5w		stk	stk	3w	stk		
5	40090	1.02			1.35			1.30	2.02	1.02	1.38		
Neopart	237612				stk			stk	stk	3w	stk		

Pace		RFQ# 424799											
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL											
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified													
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Eldorado	Kirks	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	CBM US	A&A
5	41132	93.10		133.53				93.10	148.20	114.88	155.73		
Mohawk	237605	-		1w				stk	60d	3w	9w		
1	30411	381.06				381.06							
Eldorado	237603	-				stk							
4	10411	129.06				131.24	130.00		129.06		153.02		
Muncie	237606	-				stk	stk		stk		stk		
6	41273	42.60		47.75		53.39		52.74	53.00	42.60	59.68		
Neopart	237612	-		1w		3w		unapproved part	30d	3w	stk		
1	41282	39.43				39.43							
Eldorado	237603	-				6w							
1	41283	41.24				41.24							
Eldorado	237603	-				stk							
2	41294	1,603.35				1,603.35					1,654.50		
Aftermarket Parts	237613	-				25w					stk-quicker delivery		
2	200973	115.65				115.67					115.65		
Aftermarket Parts	237613	-				4w					stk		

	Pace		RFQ# 424799										
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL											
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified													
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Eldorado	Kirks	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	CBM US	A&A
3	110003	202.39				221.00			202.39		260.06		
Muncie	237606	-				stk			stk		stk		
1	110004	131.02				131.02							
Eldorado	237603	-				stk							
5	410000	190.72				190.72		208.93	213.89	197.04	244.68		
Eldorado	237603	-				6w		2w	30d	8w	stk		
8	410010	133.84		401.09	177.73	336.35	166.90	133.84	207.59	176.45	230.60		
Neopart	237612	-		1w	stk	3w	stk	unapproved part	stk	3w	stk		
5	2010004	15.67			32.23	15.67			39.93	34.40	46.95		
Eldorado	237603	-			stk	7w			30d	4w	5w		
1	210002	295.36				295.36							
Eldorado	237603	-				22w							
1	110006	300.46				300.46							
Eldorado	237603	-				16w							
5	310008	109.54			117.54	110.00	109.54		118.91		151.55		
Kirks	237604	-			4w	8w	stk		105d		13w		

[illegible]

	RFQ# 424799												
WHITE=NO BID	Pace	TOTAL											
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified													
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Suburban Truck	Gillig	Eldorado	Kirks	Mohawk	Muncie	Neopart	Aftermarket Parts	CBM US	A&A
3	410107	161.72							193.93	161.72	229.19		
Neopart	237612	-							60d	10w	9w		
3	310052	166.98							188.72	166.98	196.81		
Neopart	237612	-							30d	3w	stk		
4	410109	687.22						687.22	721.43		1,524.54	972.12	
Aftermarket Parts	237613	-						unapproved part	unapproved part		15w	unapproved part	
4	410111	687.22						687.22	721.43		1,524.54	972.12	
Aftermarket Parts	237613	-						unapproved part	unapproved part		stk	unapproved part	
4	410119	34.10						34.10	252.24		174.15	93.00	
Aftermarket Parts	237613	-						unapproved part	unapproved part		stk	unapproved part	