

Pace

RFQ# 424801

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
3	290415	725.00			725.00				977.47				725.52		
Gillig	237627	-			stk				2w				6w		
4	220309	49.00			57.16		49.00		58.21	53.40					
Midwest Transit	237632	-			4w		unapproved part		stk	2w					
3	151458	234.13			234.13		237.21		314.14						
Gillig	237627	-			stk		8w		stk						
5	71441	7.57			8.56	7.57	13.56	10.65	16.34						
Gillig	237627				stk	unapproved part	5w	stk	26w						
3	180669	229.27			229.27		243.60		243.05						
Gillig	237627	-			stk		5w		stk						
4	70220	7.60			22.75	7.60	31.53		47.58						
Mohawk	237628	-			stk	stk	8w		stk						
3	72143	11.00			14.99		11.00		15.12						
Eldorado	237629	-			stk		6w		stk						
4	290028	26.59				28.00	27.52	44.75	26.59						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-				12d	unapproved part	stk	3w						
5	210993	669.11			717.68	785.99	822.09		734.10				669.11		
Neopart	237635	-			6w	20d	unapproved part		stk				3w		
3	290645	48.13					48.13		101.45				60.00		

Pace

RFQ# 424801

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
Eldorado	237629						stk		5w				6w		
2	290531	26.90			26.90				39.54						
Gillig	237627				stk				stk						
1	220341	95.71					95.71								
Eldorado	237629						stk								
3	71100	0.11				0.11	3.16		0.14						
Mohawk	237628					stk	unapproved part		stk						
3	210976	27.72				27.72	30.20		45.99						
Mohawk	237628	-				stk	3w		7w						
3	211006	82.25				82.25			101.57				85.27		
Neopart	237635					unapproved part			15w				3w		
4	70706	8.30			27.01	8.30	23.92		43.35						
Eldorado	237629				stk	unapproved part	stk		stk						
4	71179	0.68	4.97			0.68	0.73		1.17						
Mohawk	237628	-	2w			stk	unapproved part		5w						
3	72109	1,918.27			1,918.27		1,934.96		2,842.86						
Gillig	237627	-			12w		stk		19w						
2	151964	27.00					27.00		55.39						
Eldorado	237629	-					stk		stk						

	Pace		RFQ# 424801													
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL														
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
3	72162	24.68					39.07	24.68		42.51						
Eldorado	237629	-					2w	10w		stk						
1	72163	577.40						577.40								
Eldorado	237629	-						6w								
3	72167	35.27				35.27				51.32				44.55		
Gillig	237627	-				stk				13w				10w		
3	72181	1,021.45				1,075.00		1,021.45		1,492.39						
Eldorado	237629	-				6w		14w		17w						
3	72216	184.43				185.00		184.43		184.87						
Eldorado	237629	-				stk		18w		stk						
1	250709	63.20						63.20								
Eldorado	237629	-						stk								
2	180833	142.24				142.24				182.17						
Gillig	237627	-				12w				20w						
3	72301	320.94						414.00	320.94	697.48						
Kirks	237630	-						unapproved part	stk	9w						
3	72301	320.94						414.00	320.94	697.48						
Kirks	237630	-						unapproved part	stk	9w						
2	170707	279.80						279.80							500.00	

Pace

RFQ# 424801

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
Eldorado	237629	-					4w							stk	
2	290695	66.93					66.93		104.58						
Eldorado	237629	-					22w		stk						
4	290696	18.10				31.70	28.75		28.50			18.10			
CBM	237634	-				unapproved part	16w		stk			stk			
2	170716	1,291.01			1,309.03		1,291.01								
Eldorado	237629	-			8w		8w								
1	211124	3.60									3.60				
Filter Services	237633	-									2w				
3	220419	3.93					3.93		4.15	4.30					
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-					unapproved part		stk	3wk					
2	170719	114.65					114.65							214.39	
Eldorado	237629	-					4w							stk	
3	170722	137.58					137.58		272.53					212.13	
Eldorado	237629	-					4w		9w					stk	
1	710004	74.73					74.73								
Eldorado	237629	-					3w								
2	1810000	1,334.12			1,334.12				1,680.59						
Gillig	237627	-			12w				14w						

Pace

RFQ# 424801

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
1	1510022	60.90					60.90								
Eldorado	237629	-					4w								
1	1510036	315.76							315.76						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-							stk						
1	1510037	315.76							315.76						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-							stk						
1	2110016	3.84									3.84				
Filter Services	237633	-									3w				
2	710057	78.50		78.50					114.62						
Cummins	237626	-		stk					stk						
4	2110034	77.42			85.99	97.07			90.45				77.42		
Neopart	237635	-			6w	unapproved part			stk				3w		
4	2110039	799.69				943.12	799.69		884.83				816.09		
Neopart	237635	-				2w	unapproved part		6w				6w		
1	1710052	41.25					41.25								
Eldorado	237629	-					6w								
1	1710054	41.75					41.75								
Eldorado	237629	-					stk								
1	1710055	33.00					33.00								

Pace

RFQ# 424801

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
Eldorado	237629	-					stk								
4	2110061	838.35				838.35	1,040.22		1,162.60				1,090.45		
Mohawk	237628	-				stk	4w		15w				3w		
2	2110062	626.87							729.10				626.87		
Neopart	237635	-							29w				3w		
4	2110064	13,587.80				14,714.27	21,985.00		14,462.62				13,587.80		
Neopart	237635	-				2w	8w		16w				6w		
6	710149	564.00	668.78		721.44	643.32	1,454.42		1,546.60						564.00
Crossline	237636	-	stk		stk	2w	unapproved part		5w						stk
2	1810037	824.00			824.00				1,108.00						
Gillig	237627	-			12w				15w						
2	1810038	70.57			70.57				83.32						
Gillig	237627	-			12w				stk						
2	710166	361.51		361.51					527.84						
Cummins	237626	-		stk					5w						
2	2110075	4,103.77							4,605.54				4,103.77		
Neopart	237635	-							20w				8w		
4	2510070	5.07			5.10		5.36		6.31				5.07		
Neopart	237635	-			stk		8w		stk				3w		

Pace

RFQ# 424801

WHITE=NO BID

		TOTAL													
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified															
NO # of Bids	Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	Cummins	Gillig	Mohawk	Eldorado	Kirks	Aftermarket Parts	Midwest Transit	Filter Services	CBM	Neopart	Translite	Crossline
-	710206	-													
		-													
2	1610165	47.71			47.71				53.81						
Gillig	237627	-			stk				stk						
1	1610169	504.19							504.19						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-							5w						
1	2110170	66.48							66.48						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-							20w						
3	1510290	7.42			9.99	7.42			11.48						
Gillig	237627	-			stk	unapproved part			stk						
-	710379	-													
		-													
2	1610193	97.91			99.50				97.91						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-			stk				stk						
1	1810089	31.33							31.33						
Aftermarket Parts	237631	-							stk						
2	2110243	9.22							9.66	9.22					
Midwest Transit	237632	-							stk	2w					
1	1710174	800.00					800.00								

