

		RFQ# 424854																	
Pace																			
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
Sku		Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																			
6	41131	51.10				132.99				155.10	147.60	119.36					111.52	51.10	
Mohawk	237689	-				stk				14w	60d	3w					4w	stk	
5	290620	128.04								175.71	161.01	128.04					169.37		143.45
Neopart	237682	-								stk	30d	4w					10w		stk
5	72079	406.39								578.87	483.80					406.39	447.03		425.00
Kirks	237686	-								17w	30d					stk	4w		stk
1	72125	15.75															15.75		
Eldorado	237687																8w		
8	200901	64.80								104.38	82.94	75.29	87.75	73.59			64.80	72.73	84.99
Eldorado	237687	-								stk	stk	3w	2w	2w			6w	stk	stk
7	10192	11.51								17.19	12.14				15.01	12.41	11.51	12.15	13.98
Muncie	237681	-								stk	stk				stk	stk	unapproved part	unapproved part	stk
6	10194	14.57								22.73	15.69				16.94	14.57		15.82	17.03
Kirks	237686	-								stk	stk				stk	stk		unapproved part	stk
6	71441	7.75								16.34	8.55					10.68	13.56	7.75	8.56
Muncie	237681	-								26w	stk					stk	6w	unapproved part	stk
4	180789	52.61								52.61							80.83	111.29	54.29
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								stk							stk	unapproved part	6w
5	200522	25.46								245.33	25.99	59.84	35.42					25.46	
Mohawk	237689									5w	stk	4w	2w					stk	
5	10170	0.88								2.73	2.66	2.01						0.88	2.67
Mohawk	237689									stk	21d	3w						stk	stk
5	130581	75.32	83.13							102.02			127.26					75.32	82.91
Mohawk	237689		stk							stk			10w					stk	stk
6	290028	26.59								26.59	28.59	38.32				46.42	27.52	27.86	

		Pace		RFQ# 424854																
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL																	
			0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
NO # of Bids		Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
	Aftermarket Parts	237680									4w	21d	4w				stk	8w	unapproved part	
	4	60695	4.02			10.01					11.62	11.78							4.02	
	Cummins	237675	-			stk					6w	60d							unapproved part	
	7	200092	54.47								68.87	57.57	54.47	115.25	61.30				60.59	58.26
	Neopart	237682									stk	stk	4w	2w	1w				stk	stk
	6	210993	667.22								734.10	667.22	669.11					822.09	792.16	713.95
	Muncie	237681									15w	stk	6w					18w	stk	8w
	5	170625	245.67								337.59	319.59						287.79	375.82	245.67
	Gillig	237690	-								14w	stk						8w	stk	6w
	8	40036	59.03								86.91	166.53	153.56	209.98	143.05			87.48	59.03	146.99
	Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								stk	stk	4w	2w	2w			14w	unapproved part	stk
	6	40867	31.11				33.44				54.45	37.15				31.11			37.83	38.14
	Vehicle Maintenance	237685	-			stk					stk	stk				stk			unapproved part	stk
	9	40953	14.70				33.54				43.05	16.31	45.88	17.89		14.70	17.02		34.06	14.75
	Vehicle Maintenance	237685	-			stk					stk	stk	stk	2w		stk	stk		unapproved part	stk
	3	290531	26.90								39.54	31.30								26.90
	Gillig	237690	-								stk	stk								stk
	1	220228	23.17								23.17									
	Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								stk									
	9	81262	7.19	8.41			7.55		7.19		15.01	7.46				7.54	10.95		8.48	16.65
	A&A Auto	237677	-	10d		stk			5d		3w	stk				stk	stk		stk	stk
	7	200863	10.48	11.72			10.58		10.54		21.01	13.99				10.48			11.26	
	Vehicle Maintenance	237685	-	10d		stk			5d		9w	30d				stk			stk	
	4	211006	81.82								101.57	84.52	85.27						81.82	
	Muncie	237681	-								14w	stk	6w						unapproved part	

[illegible]

[illegible]

		Pace		RFQ# 424854																
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL																	
			0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
		Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
	5	290673	1,487.00								1,963.35	1,642.42	1,580.19					1,487.00		1,572.34
Eldorado		237687	-								7w	21d	4w					6w		8w
	3	10416	529.47								534.60	640.25						529.47		
Eldorado		237687	-								8w	stk						8w		
	4	290679	81.00								108.04	96.16	89.62							81.00
Gillig		237690	-								stk	21d	4w							stk
	5	41288	114.51								178.42	159.60	140.19					137.50		114.51
Gillig		237690	-								stk	stk	7w					stk		stk
	4	152032	175.00								240.16	188.00						182.32		175.00
Eldorado		237687	-								7w	stk						8w		6w
	2	180833	142.24								182.17									142.24
Eldorado		237687	-								20w									10w
	5	211091	375.76								515.29	411.60	451.09						375.76	511.05
Mohawk		237689	-								50w	stk	3w						stk	4w
	5	200964	22.33								52.71	42.97	40.55					30.59	22.33	
Mohawk		237689	-								stk	stk	3w					8w	stk	
	5	200965	8.57								11.87	25.10						15.94	29.58	8.57
Gillig		237690	-								stk	30d						stk	unapproved part	stk
	3	72301	379.00								697.48						379.00	414.00		
Kirks		237686	-								9w						stk	4w		
	2	170707	275.95							275.95								416.50		
Translite		237678	-							stk								6w		
	7	81519	56.17						122.99		56.17	97.66		84.98	113.00		72.00		121.87	
Aftermarket Parts		237680	-						2w		stk	stk		10d	2w		stk		unapproved part	
	3	170716	1,274.11									1,288.19						1,274.11		1,309.03

Pace		RFQ# 424854																		
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																		
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0			0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
Sku		Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig	
NO # of Bids																				
Eldorado		237687	-								30d						12w		6w	
4		1710014	27.77							36.85	29.94						27.94		27.77	
Gillig		237690	-							7w	stk						6w		stk	
4		1710015	41.87							58.31	46.46						41.87		43.74	
Eldorado		237687	-							7w	stk						6w		4w	
1		710004	54.13														54.13			
Eldorado		237687	-														6w			
8		410003	211.00							310.47	229.20	212.71			220.55	211.00	366.00	237.07	225.00	
Kirks		237686	-							6w	21d	4w			stk	stk	6w	unapproved part	6w	
9		410006	169.00	391.50		327.38				281.52	259.44	214.80				169.00	274.49	347.80	215.00	
Kirks		237686	-	2d		stk				stk	stk	3w				stk	4w	stk	stk	
5		2210000	52.09							67.92	52.21			59.54			52.09		53.51	
Eldorado		237687	-							stk	stk			1w			5w		stk	
3		1610017	185.82							241.38	195.52								185.82	
Gillig		237690	-							stk	stk								stk	
5		110005	431.27			487.71				568.23	545.85	431.27							435.70	
Neopart		237682	-			stk				20w	84d	3w							stk	
4		2510007	785.68							1,066.31		820.36					785.68		787.01	
Eldorado		237687	-							5w		3w					10w		stk	
4		810007	372.66		394.00					723.14	699.96						372.66			
Eldorado		237687	-	stk						stk	30d						6w			
7		2010016	171.13							283.94	225.40	206.92	275.70	212.01			171.13	244.61		
Eldorado		237687	-							4w	30d	4w	2w	2w			8w	unapproved part		
7		2010020	56.81	87.15						83.01	66.69	62.88		56.81				82.61	68.99	
Midwest Transit		237684	-	4d						5w	stk	4w		4w				stk	12w	

		Pace		RFQ# 424854																
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL																	
			0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
		Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
	4	2110012	813.00								1,027.53	875.75					930.00	813.00		
	Eldorado	237687	-								15w	140d					12w	24w		
	2	1010005	267.74								453.39							267.74		
	Eldorado	237687	-								stk							stk		
	5	610018	17.39			70.85		69.00			103.44	84.23							17.39	
	Crossline	237676	-			stk		stk			stk	30d							unapproved part	
	3	810026	1,373.79			1,373.79					2,113.88	1,599.83								
	Cummins	237675	-			stk					9w	stk								
	4	810028	80.78								156.07	148.56						137.43		80.78
	Gillig	237690	-								23w	stk						26w		stk
	5	610026	134.00								172.88		134.00	138.59			145.00		140.04	
	Neopart	237682	-								stk		4w	10d			stk		unapproved part	
	5	2110019	415.00								457.64	481.73	415.00						550.33	438.02
	Neopart	237682	-								stk	21d	3w						3w	stk
	3	710057	80.05			80.05					114.62								86.47	
	Cummins	237675	-			stk					stk								3w	
	2	1010018	33.35								33.35	61.28								
	Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								stk	stk								
	4	2110027	3.54								4.91	5.17	4.10						3.54	
	Mohawk	237689	-								stk	MOQ	3w						stk	
	5	2110034	77.42								90.45	95.95	77.42						96.64	85.99
	Neopart	237682	-								11w	60d	3w						unapproved part	stk
	6	2110037	365.00		365.00						2,232.01	2,348.48	1,953.95					1,997.06	2,362.95	
	Neopart	237682	-		rebuild part - looking for reman						27w	21d	3w					14w	3w	
	2	810048	31.56								51.14	31.56								

Pace		RFQ# 424854																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
Sku		Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																			
Muncie	237681	-								9w	stk								
1	210013	286.52															286.52		
Eldorado	237687	-															10w		
4	610049	9.41			9.41					12.89	11.16							11.73	
Cummins	237675	-			stk					stk	stk							3w	
1	810050	157.28															157.28		
Eldorado	237687	-															8w		
2	810051	140.00								140.00							140.00		
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								stk							4w		
1	810061	6,223.94								6,223.94									
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								9w									
5	810065	15.25			61.86					90.33	74.53		15.25					39.49	
CBM	237683	-			stk					9w	30d		4w					unapproved part	
3	810086	122.27			122.27					167.54	142.50								
Cummins	237675	-			stk					stk	30d								
6	2110061	897.35								1,162.60	1,238.00	981.41					1,040.22	897.35	1,272.57
Mohawk	237689	-								stk	21d	3w					4w	stk	4w
4	2110062	567.40								729.10	767.50	626.87						567.40	
Neopart	237682	-								29w	120d	12w						unapproved part	
2	1210038	3,059.00					3,059.00			5,235.23									
Crossline	237676	-					stk			9w									
2	610061	5.25								18.32							5.25		
Eldorado	237687	-								stk							stk		
4	2110063	57.84								61.95	64.50	57.84						168.90	
Neopart	237682	-								18w	21d	3w						3w	

		Pace		RFQ# 424854																
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL																	
			0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																				
		Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
	5	2110064	13,501.90								14,462.62	13,501.90	13,587.80					21,984.83	14,962.00	
Muncie		237681	-								16w	21d	3w					8w	3w	
	3	710136	787.69								2,790.43								787.69	1,076.60
Mohawk		237689	-								20w								3w	8w
	-	2110063	-																	
			-																	
	-	2110064	-																	
			-																	
	-	710136	-																	
			-																	
	6	1010032	86.62			174.46		154.00			249.73			266.37				187.34	86.62	
Crossline		237676	-			stk		stk			6w			10w				3w	unapproved part	
	5	610064	122.80			122.80					168.27	146.10		154.20					152.45	
Cummins		237675	-			stk					stk	stk		2w					24d	
	4	810101	327.01			353.60					480.81	327.01							408.78	
Cummins - stock on hand		237675	-			stk					6w	120d							4w	
	5	710146	384.50		385.08						526.74						385.08	384.50		395.00
Eldorado		237687	-		stk						stk						stk	4w		stk
	3	1010035	161.48			161.48					192.38	190.00								
Cummins		237675	-			stk					7w	30d								
	1	710157	40.00															40.00		
Eldorado		237687	-															4w		
	6	1010038	29.00			72.24		29.00			105.47	86.00					32.00		37.66	
Crossline		237676	-			stk		stk			stk	stk					stk		unapproved part	
	5	2110074	2,115.87								2,531.10	2,636.42	2,335.62						2,115.87	2,475.00

		Pace		RFQ# 424854																
WHITE=NO BID			TOTAL																	
			0			0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	
Green=Disqualified																				
		Sku	Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																				
	3	1110003	181.92								213.97	218.00							181.92	
Mohawk		237689	-								9w	stk							3w	
	4	810178	297.50								389.74	317.77		403.85					297.50	
Eldorado		237687	-								stk	stk		10w					3w	
	5	2110100	195.32								208.24	221.80	195.32						229.38	209.35
Neopart		237682	-								stk	21d	3w						3w	stk
	5	2110103	109.58								122.99	114.99	109.58						134.85	124.14
Neopart		237682	-								19w	stk	3w						unapproved part	stk
	-	110040	-																	
			-																	
	-	110041	-																	
			-																	
	3	1610106	6.14								6.17							6.14		6.50
Eldorado		237687	-								stk							8w		4w
	2	1610112	175.27								218.21									175.27
Gillig		237690	-								stk									stk
	3	810192	2,019.00					2,019.00			3,183.53								2,417.48	
Crossline		237676	-					stk			9w								5w	
	2	710213	2,449.00					2,449.00			4,945.62									
Crossline		237676	-					stk			12w									
	1	710247	613.67															613.67		
Eldorado		237687	-															10w		
	4	1010049	1,365.00								3,616.76	3,637.20	1,441.80				1,365.00			
Kirks		237686	-								9w	60d	3w				stk			
	2	810229	24.26								30.11	24.26								

	Pace		RFQ# 424854																
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
	Skus	Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																			
Muncie		237681	-							stk	stk								
4	2210044	202.49								219.54	233.80	202.49						235.13	
Neopart		237682	-							23w	21d	12w						5w	
6	410095	114.51								150.43	136.00	117.03			187.63		115.05		114.51
Gillig		237690	-							stk	30d	7w			stk		stk		stk
3	810243	9.52								11.46	9.52							10.32	
Muncie		237681	-							stk	30d							3w	
3	1710082	58.60								71.67	58.60								67.94
Muncie		237681	-							5w	30d								6w
2	810279	526.00								1,111.65	526.00								
Muncie		237681	-							9w	21d								
2	1710101	66.71							171.20	66.71									
Aftermarket Parts		237680	-						stk	stk									
5	2110152	108.60								124.05	132.15	108.60						150.83	126.13
Neopart		237682	-							stk	21d	3w						3w	4w
1	610137	1.27								1.27									
Aftermarket Parts		237680	-							stk									
4	610139	48.05								140.79	120.85						112.55	48.05	
Eldorado		237687	-							stk	stk						3w	unapproved part	
1	1510242	330.91								330.91									
Aftermarket Parts		237680	-							7w									
1	1510247	1,609.92								1,609.92									
Aftermarket Parts		237680	-							7w									
3	1010075	165.10								192.38	165.10							167.17	
Muncie		237681	-							5w	30d							3w	

Pace		RFQ# 424854																	
WHITE=NO BID		TOTAL																	
		0			0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0	0	0		0	0	0
Green=Disqualified																			
Sku		Winning bid	Interstate Power	P&G Keene	Cummins	Suburban Truck	Crossline	A&A Auto	Translite	Aftermarket Parts	Muncie	Neopart	CBM	Midwest Transit	Vehicle Maintenance	Kirks	Eldorado	Mohawk	Gillig
NO # of Bids																			
2	2910055	720.97								1,364.19	720.97								
Muncie	237681	-								7w	30d								
2	410116	14.70								18.66	14.70								
Muncie	237681	-								stk	21d								
1	1610187	283.17								283.17									
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								8w									
4	2110175	136.97								153.71	161.88	136.97						186.09	
Neopart	237682	-								stk	21d	3w						3w	
1	410126	21.67								21.67									
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								6w									
1	2110188	250.94								250.94									
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								9w									
2	2110197	0.50								0.50	4.36								
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								stk	60d								
4	2110202	548.45								589.75	615.77	548.45						731.38	
Neopart	237682	-								11w	21d	3w						3w	
4	2110203	807.04								860.42	905.78	807.04						862.80	
Neopart	237682	-								21w	120d	3w						3w	
1	710404	197.25																	197.25
Gillig	237690	-																	stk
1	1010092	917.37															917.37		
Eldorado	237687	-															25w		
1	2510177	12,221.00								12,221.00									
Aftermarket Parts	237680	-								33w									
4	2110223	7,859.64								11,370.44	7,970.72			7,859.64					8,599.51

[illegible]

RFQ# 424854

TOTAL

0

0

0

1

1

1

[illegible]

0

0

[illegible]